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On the eve of her wedding, Sky Elizabeth, the earl of Fife’s eldest daughter, learns of her betrothed’s
murderous plot against her. As she flees, Sky falls through a mysterious portal in time, landing at the feet of
a twenty-first-century American knight.

Struan, the bastard son of the earl of Sutherland, escaped death through time’s portal once. Recognizing what
has befallen the frightened woman, he vows to protect her even while Sky, with a trace of fae blood in her
veins, senses his resentment.

Despite their growing attraction, she’s determined to find a way home to avert a clan war. Though he cannot
deny his desire, he fears that helping her return to the past will surely lead to his demise. As the two work
together, passion ignites and an unbreakable bond forms—but will it be enough to sustain them through the
perils they’ll face in the past? Can their love have a future?
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From reader reviews:

Yolanda Osuna:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a stroll, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or even read a book titled The
Highlander's Vow (The Novels of Loch Moigh)? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You realize beside
you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it
has the opinion or you have other opinion?

Robert Haas:

This book untitled The Highlander's Vow (The Novels of Loch Moigh) to be one of several books which best
seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it.
You will easily to buy this book in the book retail outlet or you can order it through online. The publisher
with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can read this book in your
Mobile phone. So there is no reason for you to past this publication from your list.

Loren Hatmaker:

Beside this kind of The Highlander's Vow (The Novels of Loch Moigh) in your phone, it can give you a way
to get nearer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you might got here is
fresh from the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow town. It is good thing
to have The Highlander's Vow (The Novels of Loch Moigh) because this book offers to you personally
readable information. Do you at times have book but you rarely get what it's all about. Oh come on, that
won't happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, just like
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book and read it from today!

Joshua Hsu:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Highlander's Vow (The Novels of Loch
Moigh) was colorful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book The Highlander's Vow (The
Novels of Loch Moigh) has many kinds or style. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or
Private investigator Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book
are generally make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for
you and try to like reading this.
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