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This historical novel adds for the first time the Indian point of view to the Spanish chronicles about
Coronado's expedition in America's first named Indian war.  Coronado's Spaniards and Mexican Indian allies
fought the Tiguex War against the Pueblo Indians between present-day Albuquerque and Santa Fe in 1540-
42.

The novel follows a young Pueblo warrior who reluctantly takes leadership of his people in a time of crisis,
overcoming self-doubt to lead Puebloans in guerilla warfare against the Spaniards.

Praise for Winter of the Metal People and author Dennis Herrick

"A riveting historical novel of immense scholarship and insight. Dennis Herrick makes the story of the first●

American Indians in the West to face the military might of European forces as vivid and real as if
Coronado's expedition had ridden out of Mexico yesterday. Winter of the Metal People will forever
influence your perception of the stunning landscapes and rich culture of the Southwest."--Margaret Coel,
author of Killing Custer

"In Winter of the Metal People Dennis Herrick, journalist and award-winning writer of fiction, offers us a●

consummately humane novel of the first encounters between Pueblo peoples of the Southwest and a
European, African, and Native American expedition led by Francisco Vázquez de Coronado in the early
1540s. Herrick skillfully brings the Native side of those encounters into vivid focus. We are brought to
imagine the complexity and variety of Pueblo reactions as they struggle to come to grips with the foreign
presence and how it violently impacts their lives and traditions."--Richard Flint, Historian, author of No
Settlement, No Conquest: A History of the Coronado Entrada

"A vivid historical novel that brings to life the epic winter of 1540-41 as Spanish and Pueblo Indian worlds●

first collided. Herrick's narrative--driven by extant annals of the Coronado expedition, recent
archaeological research, and Pueblo accounts--is the closest we will ever get to standing on a hill above an
ancient Pueblo community and witnessing the gritty reality of history. It is a masterful eye opener."--David
E. Stuart, Professor of Anthropology, University of New Mexico, author of Prehistoric New Mexico,
Anasazi America, and The Ancient Southwest
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From reader reviews:

Roxanne Jimenez:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content.
As it is known to us that book is very important for us. The book Winter of the Metal People: The Untold
Story of America's First Indian War seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of course
you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The publication Winter of the
Metal People: The Untold Story of America's First Indian War is not only giving you considerably more new
information but also being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your own spend time to read
your book. Try to make relationship while using book Winter of the Metal People: The Untold Story of
America's First Indian War. You never experience lose out for everything when you read some books.

William Todaro:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or data even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era which can be always change and progress. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what one you should start with. This Winter of the Metal People: The
Untold Story of America's First Indian War is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world.
Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Sara Jones:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get
a lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world may share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is this
Winter of the Metal People: The Untold Story of America's First Indian War.

Jack Bemis:

Precisely why? Because this Winter of the Metal People: The Untold Story of America's First Indian War is
an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will shock you
with the secret the item inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who have write the book in
such incredible way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey
the meaning completely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going
to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of gains than the other book get such as help improving your
ability and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I ended up you I will



go to the publication store hurriedly.
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