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FIRST-CLASS MALE is book one in the new sensual historical romance series, You've Got Mail, about the
five Carpenter sisters and their quest for love. In FIRST-CLASS MALE, optimistic Callie Carpenter leaves
her sisters behind, hoping for the chance at a new, exciting life as a mail-order bride. But when she is
kidnapped by a notoriously cruel gang of outlaws during a train robbery, her hopes come to a screeching
halt.

U.S. Marshal Mason Greer has been hot on the Folsom Gang's trail for nearly a month, and when he and his
men raid the outlaw's camp, he arrives just in time to save Callie from a brutal end. This is his mission, his
life's only purpose. To catch each and every outlaw and put them behind bars where they can never hurt
anyone again. Mason has no time for romance and after a tragic loss years ago, he has no heart for it either.
But when he finds himself desiring beautiful and captivating Callie, will he be strong enough to fight it? Or
will he wind up losing the best thing that's ever happened to him--Callie's love?

Sensual Content. 46,000 words.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Cunningham:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, quick story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying First Class Male (You've
Got Mail Book 1) that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book.
Reading habit all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world better then how they
react in the direction of the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky
particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you who want to
start examining as your good habit, you are able to pick First Class Male (You've Got Mail Book 1) become
your personal starter.

Teresa Howard:

In this particular era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you have to do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to get a look at some books. On
the list of books in the top listing in your reading list is actually First Class Male (You've Got Mail Book 1).
This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious person. By
looking right up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.

Mamie Salinas:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we would like. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This publication First Class Male (You've Got Mail Book 1) was filled with regards to
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people
has several feel when they reading the book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel
enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you just wanted.

Patricia Ramirez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you know
that little person such as reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them are these claims First
Class Male (You've Got Mail Book 1).
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