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In this first extensive study of contemporary Hawaiian literature, Brandy Nalani McDougall examines a
vibrant selection of fiction, poetry, and drama by emerging and established Hawaiian authors, including
Haunani-Kay Trask, John Dominis Holt, Imaikalani Kalahele, and Victoria Nalani Kneubuhl. At the center
of the analysis is a hallmark of Hawaiian aesthetics—kaona, the intellectual practice of hiding and finding
meaning that encompasses the allegorical, the symbolic, the allusive, and the figurative.

With a poet’s attention to detail, McDougall interprets examples of kaona, guiding readers through olelo
no'eau (proverbs), mo‘olelo (literature and histories), and mooku'auhau (genealogies) alongside their
contemporary literary descendants, unveiling complex layers of Hawaiian identity, culture, history, politics,
and ecology.

Throughout, McDougall asserts that “kaona connectivity” not only carries bright possibilities for connecting
the present to the past, but it may also ignite a decolonial future. Ultimately, Finding Meaning affirms the
tremendous power of Indigenous stories and genealogies to give activism and decolonization movements
lasting meaning.
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From reader reviews:

John Householder:

This Finding Meaning: Kaona and Contemporary Hawaiian Literature (Critical Issues in Indigenous Studies)
book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by
reading this book will be information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting
deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This particular Finding Meaning: Kaona and
Contemporary Hawaiian Literature (Critical Issues in Indigenous Studies) without we understand teach the
one who looking at it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Finding Meaning:
Kaona and Contemporary Hawaiian Literature (Critical Issues in Indigenous Studies) can bring whenever
you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your
lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Finding Meaning: Kaona and Contemporary Hawaiian Literature
(Critical Issues in Indigenous Studies) having very good arrangement in word and also layout, so you will
not sense uninterested in reading.

Kim Marshall:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want feel
happy read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Typically the Finding Meaning: Kaona
and Contemporary Hawaiian Literature (Critical Issues in Indigenous Studies) is kind of guide which is
giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Michael Mantz:

This Finding Meaning: Kaona and Contemporary Hawaiian Literature (Critical Issues in Indigenous Studies)
is new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information as it relief your hunger details. Getting
deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having bit of digest in reading
this Finding Meaning: Kaona and Contemporary Hawaiian Literature (Critical Issues in Indigenous Studies)
can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by simply
anyone. These books create itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book type.
People who think that in publication form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So you
cannot find any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for
you actually. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book variety for your better life as well as knowledge.

Joseph Wilds:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you know



that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book. Many kinds of
books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is Finding Meaning: Kaona and Contemporary
Hawaiian Literature (Critical Issues in Indigenous Studies).
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