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How could a woman be three times accused of witchcraft and go on running a successful farmstead? Why
would men use a frying pan for cattle magic? Why did witches keep talking about the children? What kind of
a relation did Finnish witches have with authority and power? These are among the questions Raisa Maria
Toivo addresses in this study, as she explores the gender implications of the complex system of household
management and public representation in which seventeenth-century Finnish women and men negotiated
their positions. From specific case studies, Toivo broadens her narrative to include historiographical
discussion on the history of witchcraft, on women's and gender history and on early modern social history,
shedding new light on each theme. Toivo contributes to the on-going discussion in the European
historiography about whether the early modern period witnessed an improvement, decline, or simply
alteration in the conditions of oppression of women within patriarchal households by using a
multidimensional set of roles that could be adopted by women. Finally, she demonstrates convincingly that
members of the solid peasant class were not only subject of the newly forming states, but also avid users of
the court system, which they manipulated and put to work in the interests of their own individual, household,
and collective affairs.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Johnson:

The book Witchcraft and Gender in Early Modern Society: Finland and the Wider European Experience
(Women and Gender in the Early Modern World) can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book Witchcraft and Gender in Early Modern
Society: Finland and the Wider European Experience (Women and Gender in the Early Modern World)?
Wide variety you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will book can give many facts
for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or details that you
take for that, you are able to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Witchcraft and Gender in
Early Modern Society: Finland and the Wider European Experience (Women and Gender in the Early
Modern World) has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the
enormous world by wide open and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Melvin Groth:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere. The
information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider while those
information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which one
works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you
get it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will not
happen in you if you take Witchcraft and Gender in Early Modern Society: Finland and the Wider European
Experience (Women and Gender in the Early Modern World) as your daily resource information.

Ettie Hardcastle:

This book untitled Witchcraft and Gender in Early Modern Society: Finland and the Wider European
Experience (Women and Gender in the Early Modern World) to be one of several books which best seller in
this year, this is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to
buy that book in the book shop or you can order it via online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too.
It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no
reason for your requirements to past this guide from your list.

Belinda Bridges:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you
learn a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your analysis, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
Witchcraft and Gender in Early Modern Society: Finland and the Wider European Experience (Women and



Gender in the Early Modern World) provide you with a new experience in studying a book.
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