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From Captain John Smith's description of his visit to a native village in 1608 to Major Carrie Acree's letter
from Iraq in 2004, American Christmases offers firsthand impressions of the Christmas season as told in
letters, journals, memoirs, newspaper articles, poems, songs, and advertisements.

Passages from well-known people include Daniel Boone describing his Christmas as an Indian captive in
1769; George Washington begging for congressional assistance for his starving Continental Army troops at
Christmas in 1777; F. W. Woolworth conveying how he guessed wrong about the popularity of German
Christmas tree ornaments; Helen Keller experiencing her first Christmas with teacher Anne Sullivan in 1887;
Edith Wharton writing about a 1905 Christmas party at George Vanderbilt's North Carolina estate; and
Secret Service agent Edmund Starling telling about President Woodrow Wilson's secret Christmas
honeymoon.

However, some of the most moving entries come from ordinary people. Kate Cumming of Mobile, Alabama,
writes of the Christmas she spent in 1862 with the Confederate Army of Tennessee's medical service. Hinda
Satt, whose Jewish family emigrated from Poland, describes her first Christmas party at Jane Addams's Hull
House in Chicago. Inez McDonald, who served with the Army Nurse Corps, tells of a treasured handmade
Christmas card she kept during her imprisonment in a Bataan internment camp in 1943. Father Paul
O'Connor, a Jesuit missionary in Alaska, remembers a special Christmas gift he gave to an "Eskimo lass of
ten" in 1945. Army Specialist Don Odom describes a surreal experience in the Saudi Arabian desert during
Operation Desert Storm at Christmas in 1990.

By reading these 250 entries, you'll see how the role of Santa Claus has changed through the centuries, how
the Christmas tree became a symbol of the season, and how America's celebration of Christmas has evolved
over 400 years.
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From reader reviews:

Robin Curtin:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for us to
find out everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they have because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you should have this American Christmases: Firsthand Accounts of Holiday
Happenings from Early Days to Modern Times.

Theresa Walker:

Within other case, little people like to read book American Christmases: Firsthand Accounts of Holiday
Happenings from Early Days to Modern Times. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book.
So long as we know about how is important a new book American Christmases: Firsthand Accounts of
Holiday Happenings from Early Days to Modern Times. You can add know-how and of course you can
around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can realize everything! From your
country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you are able to
know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by internet system. It is called e-book.
You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Irving Wile:

The book untitled American Christmases: Firsthand Accounts of Holiday Happenings from Early Days to
Modern Times is the publication that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the reserve
content that will be shown to anyone. The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to
understand. The article writer was did a lot of research when write the book, hence the information that they
share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of American
Christmases: Firsthand Accounts of Holiday Happenings from Early Days to Modern Times from the
publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Kathleen Duff:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for you is American Christmases: Firsthand Accounts of Holiday Happenings from Early
Days to Modern Times this reserve consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This
kind of book was represented how can the world has grown up. The language styles that writer require to



explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some research when he makes this book. That's why
this book appropriate all of you.
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