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For a hundred years after the end of the Civil War, a quarter of all Americans lived under a system of
legalized segregation called Jim Crow. Together with its rigidly enforced canon of racial "etiquette," these
rules governed nearly every aspect of life?and outlined draconian punishments for infractions.

The purpose of Jim Crow was to keep African Americans subjugated at a level as close as possible to their
former slave status. Exceeding even South Africa's notorious apartheid in the humiliation, degradation, and
suffering it brought, Jim Crow left scars on the American psyche that are still felt today.  American
Nightmare examines and explains Jim Crow from its beginnings to its end: how it came into being, how it
was lived, how it was justified, and how, at long last, it was overcome only a few short decades ago. Most
importantly, this book reveals how a nation founded on principles of equality and freedom came to enact as
law a pervasive system of inequality and virtual slavery.

Although America has finally consigned Jim Crow to the historical graveyard, Jerrold Packard shows why it
is important that this scourge?and an understanding of how it happened?remain alive in the nation's
collective memory.
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From reader reviews:

Ernie Fleishman:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its cover may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer can be American Nightmare: The History of Jim Crow why because the
fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or
content is usually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to
pick up this book.

George Miller:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will
make anyone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
better to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You will see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is American Nightmare: The History of Jim Crow this e-book consist a lot of
the information with the condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world has
grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The actual
writer made some study when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Pamela Eckert:

You can obtain this American Nightmare: The History of Jim Crow by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just
simply viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by means of written or printed but additionally can you
enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking from your mobile phone
and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your
publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try
to choose suitable ways for you.

Jean Taylor:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading.
Some people likes looking at, not only science book but also novel and American Nightmare: The History of
Jim Crow or others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel
need to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those
books are helping them to add their knowledge. In various other case, beside science publication, any other
book likes American Nightmare: The History of Jim Crow to make your spare time a lot more colorful.



Many types of book like this.
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