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"Show me a hero and I will write you a tragedy," said F. Scott Fitzgerald. Perhaps no event in American
history better illustrates this view than the Civil War and its principal players in the years after the conflict.
The value of military glory and ties to greatness would turn toward the tragic even among the victors—like
earthquake survivors stumbling into another world, simply trying to make a new life. Their struggle would
be a constant tug back toward a destroyed past, and a confrontation with the reality of being strangers in their
own land.

David Hardin's stories of eleven such figures are revealing and touching: the explosive romance between
Jefferson Davis's daughter and the grandson of a Yankee abolitionist; the struggle between the irreligious
William T. Sherman and his devout Catholic wife for the soul of their unstable son; the bankrupt Ulysses
Grant's heroic race to complete his memoirs and provide for his family while dying of cancer. These are
among the stories and people in After the War, which also includes the Southern diarist Mary Chesnut, the
luckless Confederate John Bell Hood, the sometimes Klan leader Nathan Bedford Forrest, the shopaholic
Mary Lincoln, the gentlemanly Joe Johnston, the mythological Robert E. Lee, the underappreciated Union
general George Thomas, and the plucky Libbie Custer, who defended her husband best known for his
reckless disaster.

Whether Northerner or Southerner, their lives did not end at Appomattox. Their dissimilar outcomes are a
feast of irony and, collectively, a portrait of national change. With eleven black-and-white photographs.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Pippin:

The book After the War: The Lives and Images of Major Civil War Figures After the Shooting Stopped
make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable much more increase. Book
can to become your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem along with your subject. If you
can make reading a book After the War: The Lives and Images of Major Civil War Figures After the
Shooting Stopped to be your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your capable, increase your
knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You could know everything if you like open up and read a
publication After the War: The Lives and Images of Major Civil War Figures After the Shooting Stopped.
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you
think about this publication?

Lisa Maurer:

Typically the book After the War: The Lives and Images of Major Civil War Figures After the Shooting
Stopped will bring someone to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to explain the idea is
very unique. Should you try to find new book to learn, this book very acceptable to you. The book After the
War: The Lives and Images of Major Civil War Figures After the Shooting Stopped is much recommended
to you to learn. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can quicker to read the
book.

Aracely Schneider:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this publication. This After the War: The Lives and
Images of Major Civil War Figures After the Shooting Stopped is simple to develop you can read it in the
recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring often the printed
book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the actual book in your
smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Robert Defazio:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but novel and After the War: The Lives and Images of Major
Civil War Figures After the Shooting Stopped as well as others sources were given understanding for you.
After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science e-book was
created for teacher or even students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In
other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes After the War: The Lives and Images of Major Civil
War Figures After the Shooting Stopped to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like this
one.
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