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A stunning and original interpretation of an ancient system of poetic, religious, and philosophical
thought

Buried in the Egyptian desert some four thousand years ago, the Pyramid Texts are among the world’s oldest
poetry. Yet ever since the discovery of these hieroglyphs in 1881, they have been misconstrued by Western
Egyptologists as a garbled collection of primitive myths and incantations, relegating to obscurity their radiant
fusion of philosophy, scientific inquiry, and religion.

Now, in a seminal work, the classicist and linguist Susan Brind Morrow has recast the Pyramid Texts as a
coherent work of art, arguing that they should be recognized as a formative event in the evolution of human
thought. In The Dawning Moon of the Mind she explains how to read hieroglyphs, contextualizes their
evocative imagery, and interprets the entire poem. The result is a magisterial religious and philosophical text
revealing a profound consciousness of the world with astonishing parallels to Judeo-Christian culture,
Buddhism, and Tantra.

More than twenty years in the making, The Dawning Moon of the Mind is a monumental achievement that
locates one of the origins of poetic thought in Western culture. Almost before science, art, and written
language, these texts set forth the relationship between time and eternity, life and death, history and ideas. In
The Dawning Moon of the Mindthey emerge in their original luminosity and intelligence alongside a
persuasive argument for their central importance to the history of language.
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From reader reviews:

Carl Carrillo:

This The Dawning Moon of the Mind: Unlocking the Pyramid Texts are usually reliable for you who want to
be described as a successful person, why. The explanation of this The Dawning Moon of the Mind:
Unlocking the Pyramid Texts can be one of several great books you must have is actually giving you more
than just simple studying food but feed a person with information that possibly will shock your prior
knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions both in
e-book and printed ones. Beside that this The Dawning Moon of the Mind: Unlocking the Pyramid Texts
forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical
thinking that we know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Rachel Addison:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love The Dawning Moon of the Mind: Unlocking the
Pyramid Texts, you could enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of
hang type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its named reading
friends.

Beverly Thomas:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much easier to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can view that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to your account is The Dawning Moon of the Mind: Unlocking the Pyramid Texts this reserve
consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This book was represented how can the
world has grown up. The language styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer
made some research when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Thomas Crittenden:

You can obtain this The Dawning Moon of the Mind: Unlocking the Pyramid Texts by go to the bookstore or
Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for ones
knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book
through e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your
publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try



to choose correct ways for you.
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