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Shooting in the raw format gives digital photographers complete control over every aspect of image quality.
The Digital Negative is devoted exclusively to the topic and shows you how to make the most of that control
to extract the best-possible raw rendering of your digital negatives and to use Photoshop to achieve the
highest quality in your images. In this update of his best-selling book, renowned photographer and author
Jeff Schewe outlines a foolproof process for working with these digital negatives and presents his real-world
expertise on optimizing raw images. You’ll learn hands-on techniques for exposing and shooting for raw
image capture and developing a raw processing workflow, as well as Photoshop techniques for perfecting the
master image, converting color to black and white, and processing for panoramic and HDR images. This
second edition covers all the major updates and new features in Camera Raw, Lightroom, and Photoshop,
such as GPU acceleration, Radial Filters, Pano Merge, and more.

Get the best tone and color from your digital negatives.●

Use Lightroom and Camera Raw sharpening controls to maximize image quality.●

Produce stunning black and white images.●

Learn how to remove people from photos in Photoshop using Smart Objects and Layer Blending.●

Use HDR in Camera Raw and Lightroom.●

And much more!●

Visit the book’s companion website at TheDigitalNegativeBook.com for sample images and more. 
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From reader reviews:

Francis Dawson:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called The Digital Negative:
Raw Image Processing in Lightroom, Camera Raw, and Photoshop (2nd Edition)? Maybe it is to get best
activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can
wiser than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have various other opinion?

Arlene Martin:

This The Digital Negative: Raw Image Processing in Lightroom, Camera Raw, and Photoshop (2nd Edition)
book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by
reading this book is usually information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get data which is
getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This The Digital Negative: Raw Image
Processing in Lightroom, Camera Raw, and Photoshop (2nd Edition) without we recognize teach the one
who studying it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't be worry The Digital Negative: Raw
Image Processing in Lightroom, Camera Raw, and Photoshop (2nd Edition) can bring once you are and not
make your bag space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even
cellphone. This The Digital Negative: Raw Image Processing in Lightroom, Camera Raw, and Photoshop
(2nd Edition) having excellent arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not experience uninterested
in reading.

Mary Jones:

The book The Digital Negative: Raw Image Processing in Lightroom, Camera Raw, and Photoshop (2nd
Edition) has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit.
The book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research ahead of write
this book. This book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after reading this article book.

Larry Huff:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on
what types of book that you have read. In order to get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel,
comics, in addition to soon. The The Digital Negative: Raw Image Processing in Lightroom, Camera Raw,
and Photoshop (2nd Edition) offer you a new experience in reading through a book.
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