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It’s Valentine’s Day. Forget the chocolates and red roses. No more Hallmark cards. What working mothers
really want is time… So starts Suki Porter's attempt at blogging in her quest to survive being a modern jack-
of-all trades: a mother, wife, businesswoman and loyal girlfriend. But what starts off as a seemingly
straightforward exercise, turns into a meditation on friendship, workplace politics, everyday violence and
relationships. As she approaches her 40th birthday, her best friend, Carla, hands her a book which is being
secretly passed and talked about amongst women. A book that will make her realize the significance of what
she truly fears and deems important. What is the choice that Suki will make? This contemporary novel of
self-discovery reveals the often messy reality of work-life balance and modern womanhood. Its what
happens when Bridget Jones Diary meets Lean In.
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From reader reviews:

Diana Castillo:

In other case, little persons like to read book Dissecting Cotton Candy. You can choose the best book if you
love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a new book Dissecting Cotton Candy. You
can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact
from book you can understand everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you can be
known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can easily open a
book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel uninterested to
go to the library. Let's learn.

Dora Gourley:

The book Dissecting Cotton Candy can give more knowledge and information about everything you want.
So just why must we leave a very important thing like a book Dissecting Cotton Candy? A number of you
have a different opinion about book. But one aim that will book can give many data for us. It is absolutely
proper. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to
give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Dissecting Cotton Candy has simple shape but
you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by available and
read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Jean Cunningham:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by simply surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Sure, by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this specific Dissecting Cotton Candy book as
starter and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Karen Morris:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make someone
to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information much easier to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to your account is Dissecting Cotton Candy this reserve consist a lot of the information in the
condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The
dialect styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some exploration
when he makes this book. That is why this book ideal all of you.
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