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Istanbul is home to a multimillion dollar transnational music industry, which every year produces thousands
of digital music recordings, including widely distributed film and television show soundtracks. Today, this
centralized industry is responding to a growing global demand for Turkish, Kurdish, and other Anatolian
ethnic language productions, and every year, many of its top-selling records incorporate elaborately
orchestrated arrangements of rural folksongs. What accounts for the continuing demand for traditional music
in local and diasporic markets? How is tradition produced in twenty-first century digital recording studios,
and is there a "digital aesthetics" to contemporary recordings of traditional music?

In Digital Traditions: Arrangement and Labor in Istanbul's Recording Studio Culture, author Eliot Bates
answers these questions and more with a case study into the contemporary practices of recording traditional
music in Istanbul. Bates provides an ethnography of Turkish recording studios, of arrangers and engineers,
studio musicianship and digital audio workstation kinesthetics. Digital Traditions investigates the moments
when tradition is arranged, and how arrangement is simultaneously a set of technological capabilities,
limitations and choices: a form of musical practice that desocializes the ensemble and generates an extended
network of social relations, resulting in aesthetic art objects that come to be associated with a range of
affective and symbolic meanings. Rich with visual analysis and drawing on Science & Technology Studies
theories and methods, Digital Traditions sets a new standard for the study of recorded music. Scholars and
general readers of ethnomusicology, Middle Eastern studies, folklore and science and technology studies are
sure to find Digital Traditions an essential addition to their library.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Dutton:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare
time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that question simply because just their
can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on kindergarten until university need this particular Digital Tradition: Arrangement and Labor in
Istanbul's Recording Studio Culture to read.

Mark Nixon:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find book that need more
time to be examine. Digital Tradition: Arrangement and Labor in Istanbul's Recording Studio Culture can be
your answer mainly because it can be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Helen Chandler:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity along with
family or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by studying a
book. Ugh, you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
ok you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Digital Tradition:
Arrangement and Labor in Istanbul's Recording Studio Culture which is keeping the e-book version. So ,
why not try out this book? Let's view.

Brenda Villa:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This guide Digital Tradition: Arrangement and Labor in Istanbul's Recording Studio Culture
was filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence.
Some people has distinct feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can
truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you simply
wanted.
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