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It's 1943 and the Americans and Japanese are fighting a deadly war in the hot, jungle-covered volcanic
islands of the South Pacific. The outcome is in doubt and a terrible blow has fallen on American morale.
Lieutenant David Armistead, a Marine Corps hero and cousin of the President of the United States, is
missing and some say he's gone over to the enemy. Coast Guard Captain Josh Thurlow and his ragtag crew
are given the assignment to find Armistead, though not necessarily to bring him back alive. Recruited in the
hunt is a tormented and frail PT-boat skipper nicknamed "Shafty" who is also known by another name: John
F. Kennedy. When Josh is stranded in the jungles of New Georgia with a mysterious, sensual woman who
has a tendency to chop off men's heads, it's up to Kennedy to come to the rescue and complete the mission.
But to procure a gunboat, he first has to play high-stakes poker with a young naval supply officer called Nick
who happens to be the best gambler in the South Pacific. Nick has another name, too: Richard M. Nixon.
Based solidly on historical fact with echoes of James Michener, The Ambassador's Son is a thrilling tale of
the South Pacific and adventure fiction at its finest.
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From reader reviews:

Alicia Wescott:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Ambassador's Son (Josh Thurlow
Series #2). All type of book could you see on many resources. You can look for the internet solutions or
other social media.

Archie Beard:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on
what kind of guide you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education and learning books
but if you want experience happy read one having theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel.
Typically the The Ambassador's Son (Josh Thurlow Series #2) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader
unpredictable experience.

Madeline Edwards:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can
satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find publication that need
more time to be go through. The Ambassador's Son (Josh Thurlow Series #2) can be your answer since it can
be read by you actually who have those short time problems.

Tom Carter:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This kind of The Ambassador's Son (Josh Thurlow Series #2)
can give you a lot of friends because by you checking out this one book you have point that they don't and
make an individual more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This e-book offer you information that might be your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more
than various other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Ambassador's
Son (Josh Thurlow Series #2).
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