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Sheds light on one of the most important religious thinkers in the modern Muslim world.

Distinguished scholars in Islamic Studies, Middle Eastern Studies, and Modern Turkish Studies examine the
life and thought of Bediuzzaman Said Nursi (1877–1960) using a variety of approaches—theological,
philosophical, sociological, and historical—to shed new light on one of the most important thinkers and
religious leaders in the modern Muslim world. Early in his life Nursi had hoped to save the Ottoman Empire
from collapse, but after the empire gave way to the modern Turkish Republic, Nursi found himself in
disagreement with the vision of a secular, Western-style state fostered by Turkey's new leadership and
withdrew from public life. Deemed a potential threat to the young Republic, he was condemned to a life of
exile and imprisonment. This isolation, however, allowed him to write the works that were to form the basis
of a "faith movement" that would not only keep alive the Islamic religion in Turkey, but also in later decades
would become one of the most important religious movements in contemporary Turkey and an inspiration to
millions throughout the Muslim world.

“…the editor is to be congratulated for attempting to bring contemporary ideas and analyses of Said Nursi’s
writings and subsequent movements to the scholarly foreground.” — Middle East Studies Association
Bulletin

"Nursi comes across as more complicated and nuanced than a mere oppositional figure; his ambiguous
placement between a traditional thought world and a more contemporary, international, even secular and
scientific world, is what makes him interesting. This collection finds alternative categories to situate Nursi
and his followers in the context of the modern, secular Turkish Republic." — Karl K. Barbir, author of
Ottoman Rule in Damascus, 1708–1758

"I am impressed by the breadth of coverage. I have rarely encountered a collection of works on a particular
Islamic intellectual that is so thorough and varied." — Ralph Coury, coeditor of The Arab-African and
Islamic Worlds: Interdisciplinary Studies

Contributors include Ibrahim M. Abu-Rabi', Redha Ameur, Mehmet S. Aydin, Mucahit Bilici, Kelton Cobb,
Dale F. Eickelman, Yvonne Yazbeck Haddad, Ayize Jamat-Everett, Metin Karabasogálu, Bilal Kuspinar,
Oliver Leaman, Serif Mardin, Lucinda Allen Mosher, M. Sait Özervarlé, Taha 'Abdel Rahman, Fred A.
Reed, Barbara Freyer Stowasser, Sükran Vahide, and M. Hakan Yavuz.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Grinder:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important normally. The book Islam at the Crossroads: On the Life and
Thought of Bediuzzaman Said Nursi (Suny Series in Near Eastern Studies) was making you to know about
other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you.
The book Islam at the Crossroads: On the Life and Thought of Bediuzzaman Said Nursi (Suny Series in Near
Eastern Studies) is not only giving you far more new information but also to become your friend when you
experience bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship
while using book Islam at the Crossroads: On the Life and Thought of Bediuzzaman Said Nursi (Suny Series
in Near Eastern Studies). You never experience lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Thomas Kelly:

This Islam at the Crossroads: On the Life and Thought of Bediuzzaman Said Nursi (Suny Series in Near
Eastern Studies) usually are reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The
explanation of this Islam at the Crossroads: On the Life and Thought of Bediuzzaman Said Nursi (Suny
Series in Near Eastern Studies) can be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more than
just simple looking at food but feed you with information that might be will shock your before knowledge.
This book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions at e-book and
printed versions. Beside that this Islam at the Crossroads: On the Life and Thought of Bediuzzaman Said
Nursi (Suny Series in Near Eastern Studies) giving you an enormous of experience for instance rich
vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day action. So , let's have
it appreciate reading.

Andrew Howe:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your limited time to read it because all this time you only find reserve that need
more time to be examine. Islam at the Crossroads: On the Life and Thought of Bediuzzaman Said Nursi
(Suny Series in Near Eastern Studies) can be your answer since it can be read by you who have those short
extra time problems.

Elizabeth Black:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every
year has been exactly added. This book Islam at the Crossroads: On the Life and Thought of Bediuzzaman
Said Nursi (Suny Series in Near Eastern Studies) was filled regarding science. Spend your time to add your



knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has various feel when they reading any
book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like
now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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