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What does it mean to play "someone else’s music"? Intimate Distance delves into this question through a
focus on Bolivian musicians who tour Japan playing Andean music and Japanese audiences, who often go
beyond fandom to take up these musical forms as hobbyists and even as professional musicians. Michelle
Bigenho conducted part of her ethnographic research while performing with Bolivian musicians as they
toured Japan. Drawing on interviews with Bolivian musicians as well as Japanese fans and performers of
these traditions, Bigenho explores how transcultural intimacy is produced at the site of Andean music and its
performances.

Bolivians and Japanese involved in these musical practices often express narratives of intimacy and racial
belonging that reference shared but unspecified indigenous ancestors. Along with revealing the story of
Bolivian music's route to Japan and interpreting the transnational staging of indigenous worlds, Bigenho
examines these stories of closeness, thereby unsettling the East-West binary that often structures many
discussions of cultural difference and exotic fantasy.
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From reader reviews:

Arthur Dickison:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of Intimate Distance: Andean
Music in Japan book as nice and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a
book.

Betty Hood:

Typically the book Intimate Distance: Andean Music in Japan has a lot associated with on it. So when you
make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very famous author.
Tom makes some research before write this book. This book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily
after reading this article book.

Joyce Greenberg:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of Intimate Distance: Andean Music in Japan can give you
a lot of close friends because by you considering this one book you have issue that they don't and make you
more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
reserve offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than different
make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let's have Intimate Distance: Andean Music in Japan.

Chris Robins:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Intimate Distance: Andean Music in Japan was
colorful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Intimate Distance: Andean Music in Japan
has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can
read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book usually are make you bored, any
it offers you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading this.
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