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"Scandinavia is the half-forgotten sub-continent of Europe. In his trenchant analysis, Ingemar Dörfer shows
why, in the wake of the Cold War, explicit mutual commitment should inform the new relationship between
the old neutrals Sweden and Finland and the Western Alliance as a whole. An outstanding member of the
transatlantic security community, Dörfer has written a compelling book that will shape the strategic debate
on and in the Nordic world for years to come." -- Josef Joffe, Harvard University

"Dörfer's book shows the way" -- Stockholm Dagens Nyheter

Sweden and Finland continue to stand outside NATO. The Nordic Nations in the New Western Security
Regime argues carefully and vigorously that they should join. Ingemar Dörfer builds his case from a variety
of materials, covering the security situation of northern Europe, the military organizations and commitments
of the Scandinavian countries, and the future of NATO in the web of pan-European political, economic, and
military institutions.
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From reader reviews:

Cheryl Alexander:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get large
amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do
you have when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, typically the book
you have read is The Nordic Nations in the New Western Security Regime (Woodrow Wilson Center Press).

Michael Crew:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs
or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Nordic Nations in the New Western
Security Regime (Woodrow Wilson Center Press) can be the response, oh how comes? The new book you
know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek
activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Regina Schubert:

You will get this The Nordic Nations in the New Western Security Regime (Woodrow Wilson Center Press)
by visit the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you get difficulties
for ones knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by simply written or printed but can you
enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking by your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your
publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try
to choose right ways for you.

Sarah Lopez:

Book is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen have to have book to know the update information of year to help year. As we
know those books have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around
the world. By the book The Nordic Nations in the New Western Security Regime (Woodrow Wilson Center
Press) we can take more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? For being creative person must want to
read a book. Merely choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your
life with that book The Nordic Nations in the New Western Security Regime (Woodrow Wilson Center
Press). You can more pleasing than now.
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