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This is a pocket sized Homeschooling Workbook that will quickly become a treasure! Your child will adore
the detailed pictures and coloring pages of nature and animals. You will love watching your child learn Bible
verses!

Now your child can hide God's Word in his or her heart while learning to spell. This little book doesn't just
focus on how to spell, but offers your child a chance to learn 20 beautiful and meaningful Bible verses.

Why waste your child's time and energy on long lists of meaningless spelling words? This book offers a fun
and stress-free way to learn how to spell, while helping your child to understand each word in the context of
the Bible.

First your child will read, write and color the Bible Verse and focus on 5 special words in each verse. Your
child can use one to four pages per day. After completing four pages your child is rewarded with a coloring
page.

Depending on your child's abilities he or she will be prompted to write a poem using the spelling words OR
write the definition of each spelling words at the end of the book. Either method will help your child master
the meaning of the word. Older students can do both activities.

This workbook uses the Open Dyslexic Font like most books by The Thinking Tree, LLC, and encourages
coloring to help with memory and relaxation.

This book also offers the student an opportunity to practice cursive.

This is a very sweet little workbook and can be used for ages 8 to 14.

If you would like to have a beautiful opportunity to learn 20 verses from the Bible while being an excellent
example to your child, buy one of these books for yourself.

Unlike many workbooks that are tossed in the trash and forgotten, this one has eternal value, and you will not
feel like you are wasting your time as you learn the verses too.

The best way to teach a child is to be an example, that's why we strongly encourage parents and older
siblings to use this book along side younger children.
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Richards:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled Bible Time - Vocabulary - 100 Words: A Pocket Sized Coloring Book for
Christian Students - Handwriting, Spelling, Comprehension, Cursive & Coloring ... for Bible Based
Homeschooling) (Volume 1). Try to the actual book Bible Time - Vocabulary - 100 Words: A Pocket Sized
Coloring Book for Christian Students - Handwriting, Spelling, Comprehension, Cursive & Coloring ... for
Bible Based Homeschooling) (Volume 1) as your good friend. It means that it can to get your friend when
you truly feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So ,
let us make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Amanda Dell:

The particular book Bible Time - Vocabulary - 100 Words: A Pocket Sized Coloring Book for Christian
Students - Handwriting, Spelling, Comprehension, Cursive & Coloring ... for Bible Based Homeschooling)
(Volume 1) will bring you to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to elucidate the idea is
very unique. If you try to find new book to see, this book very suited to you. The book Bible Time -
Vocabulary - 100 Words: A Pocket Sized Coloring Book for Christian Students - Handwriting, Spelling,
Comprehension, Cursive & Coloring ... for Bible Based Homeschooling) (Volume 1) is much recommended
to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Richard Plummer:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you go through a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the fact
book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that
you have read. If you would like get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The Bible Time
- Vocabulary - 100 Words: A Pocket Sized Coloring Book for Christian Students - Handwriting, Spelling,
Comprehension, Cursive & Coloring ... for Bible Based Homeschooling) (Volume 1) will give you new
experience in reading a book.

Brent Campbell:

This Bible Time - Vocabulary - 100 Words: A Pocket Sized Coloring Book for Christian Students -
Handwriting, Spelling, Comprehension, Cursive & Coloring ... for Bible Based Homeschooling) (Volume 1)
is completely new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information as it relief your hunger



details. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having small amount of
digest in reading this Bible Time - Vocabulary - 100 Words: A Pocket Sized Coloring Book for Christian
Students - Handwriting, Spelling, Comprehension, Cursive & Coloring ... for Bible Based Homeschooling)
(Volume 1) can be the light food for you personally because the information inside that book is easy to get
by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in
the e-book contact form. People who think that in publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-
book is the answer. So there is no in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking
for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book kind for your better life
and also knowledge.
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