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***A Complete Novel With NO CLIFFHANGER***

Aliyah trembles as her savior enters through the darkness and smoke fills the room...

As the head nurse of the ER, Aliyah has seen more than her fair share of emergencies. When she finds
herself trapped in her own home ablaze, she is amazed by the sweet and handsome fireman that comes to her
rescue. Someone so caring he goes back into the inferno just to save her dog from the fire, risking his own
life in the process.

Days go by and she keeps thinking of the man who saved her until one day she bumps into him at the
grocery store. She tries to thank him and offers to take him out for lunch but this fireman is full of surprises.
He offers to cook her dinner instead while they get to know each other. She learns more about his past and
how he was an orphan until a wealthy family adopted him, and how he decided to follow in his new father's
footsteps and become a fireman.

They hit it off at dinner and realize they are so different, but there's a spark that keeps bringing them back
together. She loves predictability and routine, while he loves living day to day with a little danger. The
fireman shows Aliyah there is so much more to life, and that she should start really living. Everything starts
moving very fast and while Aliyah thinks she is falling for him she still has a few doubts.

A terrible accident almost takes the life of her new love, and she swears that she can't be in a relationship
where she's constantly fearing for her man's life. They break it off for good and she starts feeling very sick at
work. A concerned colleague comes to her rescue, and gives her the bittersweet news that she is also
pregnant…

Will love overcome all odds and bring them back together? Will her fireman sacrifice it all to be with her
and make them one big happy family?

Read this complete standalone romance to the end by scrolling up and clicking "Buy Now With 1
Click"

As a very special thank you to all the readers for supporting me I've included 2 Bonus Surprises in this
book. Skip to the end to read and I hope you enjoy them!

Check the "Look Inside" feature and find out how you can get 3 EXCLUSIVE Standalone BWWM
Romances, absolutely FREE, sent to you in minutes!
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From reader reviews:

Louis Venable:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of
new facts. When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of
numerous ways to share the information or their idea. Second, examining a book will make you more
imaginative. When you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you
imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to others. When
you read this Heart of Fire (BWWM Pregnancy Romance), you may tells your family, friends and soon
about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a e-book.

Mandy Conway:

Often the book Heart of Fire (BWWM Pregnancy Romance) has a lot of information on it. So when you
check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal
makes some research before write this book. This book very easy to read you can get the point easily after
perusing this book.

Kevin Shepherd:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is referred to as of
book Heart of Fire (BWWM Pregnancy Romance). You can include your knowledge by it. Without making
the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most
important that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one location to other place.

Regina Wingler:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or created from each source that will filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just in search of the Heart of Fire (BWWM Pregnancy Romance) when you essential it?
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