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This edition features the exact same content as the traditional text in a convenient, three-hole-
punched, loose-leaf version. Books a la Carte also offer a great value–this format costs significantly
less than a new textbook.
 
Weiss offers a comprehensive, traditional approach to introductory statistics, with a heavy emphasis on
mathematical reasoning and critical thinking. Weiss’s meticulous style offers careful, detailed explanations
to ease the learning process. More than 2,600 exercises involve real data from contemporary sources, which
promotes active learning and develops readers’ ability to think critically with statistics.
 
Introductory Statistics, Ninth Edition, contains parallel presentation of critical-value and p-value
approaches to hypothesis testing. This unique design allows both the flexibility to concentrate on one
approach or the opportunity for greater depth in comparing the two. The text is suitable for a one- or two-
semester course.
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From reader reviews:

Bernard Martin:

The book Introductory Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition (9th Edition) can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a book Introductory Statistics,
Books a la Carte Edition (9th Edition)? A number of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim
which book can give many details for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with your book.
Knowledge or info that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book
Introductory Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition (9th Edition) has simple shape but the truth is know: it has
great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it is very
wonderful.

Dollie Simmons:

The feeling that you get from Introductory Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition (9th Edition) is a more deep
you searching the information that hide into the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Introductory Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition (9th Edition)
giving you joy feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood
by anyone who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. That book also makes
your vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-
book style are available. We recommend you for having this kind of Introductory Statistics, Books a la Carte
Edition (9th Edition) instantly.

Stephanie Armstrong:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will see
that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you
personally is Introductory Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition (9th Edition) this reserve consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how does the world has
grown up. The words styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book suitable all of you.

Jamie Harper:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you might have it
in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This particular Introductory Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition
(9th Edition) can give you a lot of good friends because by you considering this one book you have matter
that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to
get success. This book offer you information that might be your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more



than some other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let us have Introductory
Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition (9th Edition).
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