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From the acclaimed author of A Venetian Affair comes the vivid and dramatic story of the fall of Venice and
the rise of a new age during the tumultuous Napoleonic period, as seen through the eyes of his great-great-
great-great-grandmother.

In 1787, Lucia, the beautiful sixteen-year-old daughter of a prominent Venetian statesman, is married off to
Alvise Mocenigo, scion of one of the most powerful Venetian families. But their life as a golden couple will
be suddenly transformed when Venice falls to Bonaparte. As the larger events unfolding around Lucia
mingle with her most personal concerns, we witness—through her letters to her sister and other primary
sources—her painful series of miscarriages and the pressure on her to produce an heir; her impassioned affair
with an Austrian officer and its stunning results; the glamour and strain of her career as a hostess in
Hapsburg Vienna and lady-in-waiting at the court of Napoleon’s stepson, Prince Eugène de Beauharnais, as
well as her intimate relationship with the Empress Joséphine; and her amazing firsthand account of the defeat
of Napoleon in Paris in 1814. In her later years, Lucia, regal and still beautiful and a bit battle-hardened
herself, was Byron’s landlord during the poet’s stay in Venice. In a fitting finale to this sweeping drama,
Lucia stands as a relic of a lost golden age: she created, in part, the aura that gave rise to the Romantic view
of Italy and its culture that we still nourish today.

With the brave and articulate Lucia at the center of his re-creation of this remarkable historical period,
Andrea di Robilant has once again reached across the centuries, and deep into his own past, to bring history
to rich and vivid life on the page.
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From reader reviews:

Virgil Arriola:

The event that you get from Lucia: A Venetian Life in the Age of Napoleon is the more deep you searching
the information that hide inside words the more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book
is hard to be aware of but Lucia: A Venetian Life in the Age of Napoleon giving you joy feeling of reading.
The writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by anyone who read that because the
author of this reserve is well-known enough. That book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase
well. That makes it easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We propose you for having this Lucia: A Venetian Life in the Age of Napoleon instantly.

Edward Suniga:

The publication with title Lucia: A Venetian Life in the Age of Napoleon includes a lot of information that
you can discover it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding
the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to
yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Connie Nixon:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you
learn a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, along
with soon. The Lucia: A Venetian Life in the Age of Napoleon offer you a new experience in examining a
book.

Tanya Caggiano:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This guide Lucia: A Venetian Life in the Age of Napoleon was filled in relation to
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has distinct
feel when they reading the book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a
guide. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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