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In 1989, shortly before his execution, Ted Bundy met with Robert Keppel in what would be his final
confession to the events that had occurred some years prior in Washington State. Although much of this
confession has been published in other forms and through various media outlets, this is the original version
of that confession as provided by an FOIA request made in June of 2015. It was released to me in transcribed
form by the King County Sheriff Office. What has been written of Bundy's killing spree in Washington to
date has not addressed the years prior to 1974 nor the events that happened leading up to the spring of 1974
when Bundy murdered several women in an escalating fashion.
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From reader reviews:

Dora Campfield:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
the book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all day every
day to reading a e-book. The book In Defense of Denial: Ted Bundy's Prison Interview it is quite good to
read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. If you did
not have enough space to create this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this
book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book provides high quality.

Anthony Green:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love In Defense of Denial: Ted Bundy's
Prison Interview, you can enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its known as
reading friends.

Timothy McCormack:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Try to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its protect may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in
the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer might be In Defense of Denial: Ted Bundy's Prison Interview
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint anyone. The
inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
make suggestions to pick up this book.

Roger Lee:

Beside this In Defense of Denial: Ted Bundy's Prison Interview in your phone, it could give you a way to get
nearer to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh
from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow small town. It is good
thing to have In Defense of Denial: Ted Bundy's Prison Interview because this book offers to you readable
information. Do you oftentimes have book but you seldom get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will
not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, like
treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book as well as read it from right
now!
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