
City In The Woods: The Life and Design of an
American Camp Meeting on Martha's Vineyard

Ellen Weiss

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=1555533450
http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=1555533450
http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=1555533450


City In The Woods: The Life and Design of an American
Camp Meeting on Martha's Vineyard

Ellen Weiss

City In The Woods: The Life and Design of an American Camp Meeting on Martha's Vineyard Ellen
Weiss
During the nineteenth century, Methodist camp meetings -- woodland revivals lasting several days --
flourished throughout the United States. These tented villages often evolved into permanent communities
with unique campground cottages and distinctive spatial configurations. The Wesleyan Grove camp meeting,
founded on Martha's Vineyard, Massachusetts, in 1835, is the premier example of this distinctive American
design. Anonymous planners and builders at the site innovated the richly decorated miniature cottages and
maze-like layouts that were replicated at dozens of late Victorian campgrounds across the country. In 1867,
Oak Bluffs, a planned resort that mimicked the eccentric architecture of Wesleyan Grove, was laid out next
to the already famous camp meeting. Together, these two extraordinary communities generated a sense of
otherworldliness, a magical environment that remains virtually unchanged today. Now in paperback, City in
the Woods chronicles the growth of Wesleyan Grove from a few tents in the wilderness to famed city of
cottages, and of Oak Bluffs, the "fairyland" next door. Ellen Weiss probes the ways in which the social and
religious ideals of nineteenth-century evangelism spawned this remarkable place, traces the history of its
physical forms, and recalls how the site was observed by visitors in its own time. She suggests that the
continuing American propensity to live in nature, in the suburbs, is rooted in the spiritual strength of the
camp meeting and the astonishing community type it generated. Weiss's charming and absorbing account
will appeal to architectural, cultural, and religious historians as well as to Vineyard tourists and residents
enchanted with this unique city.
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From reader reviews:

Ronda Caesar:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their own reader with their story or even
their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the knowledge
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
talent in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this City In The
Woods: The Life and Design of an American Camp Meeting on Martha's Vineyard.

Victor Parisi:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside appear
likes. Maybe you answer is usually City In The Woods: The Life and Design of an American Camp Meeting
on Martha's Vineyard why because the fantastic cover that make you consider regarding the content will not
disappoint an individual. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense
will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Rigoberto Stansell:

This City In The Woods: The Life and Design of an American Camp Meeting on Martha's Vineyard is fresh
way for you who has interest to look for some information as it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting
deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having little digest in reading this
City In The Woods: The Life and Design of an American Camp Meeting on Martha's Vineyard can be the
light food for you because the information inside that book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books
acquire itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book application form.
People who think that in publication form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So
there is absolutely no in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It
should be here for you actually. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book type for your better life in addition to
knowledge.

Mark Guerrero:

As a university student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's soul
or real their leisure activity. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
right now there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along



with can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit
your needs. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word
says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this City In The Woods: The Life and Design of an
American Camp Meeting on Martha's Vineyard can make you feel more interested to read.
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