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The SIMATIC S7-1200 PLC offers a modular design concept with similar functionality as the well-known
S7-300 series. Being the follow-up generation of the SIMATIC S7-200 the controllers can be used in a
versatile manner for small machines and small automation systems. Simple motion control functionalities are
both an integral part of the micro PLC and an integrated PROFINET interface for programming, HMI link
and CPU-CPU communication.
As part of Totally Integrated Automation (TIA) Portal, the engineering software STEP 7 Basic offers a
newly developed user interface, which is matched to intuitive operation. The functionality comprises all
interests concerning automation: From configuring the controllers via programming in the IEC languages
LAD (ladder diagram), FBD (function block diagram) and SCL (structured control language) up to program
testing.
The book presents all of the hardware components of the automation system S7-1200, as well as its
configuration and parameterization. A profound introduction into STEP 7 Basic V11 illustrates the basics of
programming and trouble shooting. Beginners learn the basics of automation with SIMATIC S7-1200 and
advanced users of S7-200 and S7-300 receive the knowledge required to work with the new PLC.

Users of STEP 7 Professional V12 will easily get along with the descriptions based on the V11. With start of
V12, the screens of the technology functions might differ slightly from the V11.
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From reader reviews:

Don Gonzales:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Automating with SIMATIC S7-1200: Configuring,
Programming and Testing with STEP 7 Basic V11; Visualization with WinCC Basic V11. Try to face the
book Automating with SIMATIC S7-1200: Configuring, Programming and Testing with STEP 7 Basic V11;
Visualization with WinCC Basic V11 as your friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you sense
alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The
book makes you far more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , we need to
make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Rosalie Cox:

The book Automating with SIMATIC S7-1200: Configuring, Programming and Testing with STEP 7 Basic
V11; Visualization with WinCC Basic V11 can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. So just why must we leave a good thing like a book Automating
with SIMATIC S7-1200: Configuring, Programming and Testing with STEP 7 Basic V11; Visualization
with WinCC Basic V11? A number of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that will book
can give many data for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you can share all of these.
Book Automating with SIMATIC S7-1200: Configuring, Programming and Testing with STEP 7 Basic V11;
Visualization with WinCC Basic V11 has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for
you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Denise Kerrigan:

This book untitled Automating with SIMATIC S7-1200: Configuring, Programming and Testing with STEP
7 Basic V11; Visualization with WinCC Basic V11 to be one of several books in which best seller in this
year, that's because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that
book in the book retail store or you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there
is no reason to you to past this publication from your list.

Doris Stone:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you read a book
you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, because book has a
lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that you have
read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you want to



entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along with soon. The
Automating with SIMATIC S7-1200: Configuring, Programming and Testing with STEP 7 Basic V11;
Visualization with WinCC Basic V11 will give you a new experience in looking at a book.
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